Lockington Parish Council Meeting Agenda Tuesday, 20th May 2025

Dear Sir/Madam,

I hereby give you notice that an ordinary meeting of Lockington Parish Council will be held on **Tuesday, May 20th, 2025, at 8 p.m.** in Lockington Village Hall. (or on termination of the annual meetings, which commence at 7 pm).

All members of the Parish Council are hereby summoned to attend and transact the agenda items listed below:

All members of the public and press are welcome to attend and may make representations to the Parish Council during the Public Participation Period, which will take place towards the end of the meeting.

Agenda Items (Subject to amendment)

25-26/1 To receive Apologies:

25-26/2 To approve the Ordinary Parish Council meeting minutes on the 15th of April 2025.

<u>25-26/3 (a) To receive and record any 'Declaration of Interest' (Pecuniary, Non-Pecuniary and/or</u> <u>Prejudicial Interest</u>) by any member of the Parish Council in respect to the agenda items listed.

25-26/3 (b) To record the nature of the Declaration of Interest identified in item 'a' above.

The Declaration of Interest should be made at the commencement of the meeting.

25-26/4 To review and resolve any East Riding of Yorkshire (ERYC) Council Business:

4.1 Feedback from Ward Councillor Jeremy Wilcock.

25-26/5 Parish Council ongoing Business Matters:

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 5.1 (a) Asset Audit review and general actions.
 - (b) Insurance Review (Sums insured)
 - (i) Street Furniture £40K
 - (ii) Defibrillator £2.2K
 - (iii) Village Hall Clock £6.7K
- 5.2 Millennium Copse registration of land.
- 5.3 'Book Stop' for Lockington.
- 5.4 Dog Fouling in the Village
- 5.5 Aike Notice Board replacement design and budget.
- 5.6 Village Green Planting of Wild Flower Grass seed.

25-26/6 Correspondence/Clerk.

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 6.1 Play equipment (Ninja Trail) email dated 20.4.25.
- 6.2 Annual Town and Parish Council Planning Liaison Meetings email dated 20.4.25.
- 6.3 Humberside Police Crime Figures email dated 20.4.25.
- 6.4 Salt Bins Winter Maintenance email dated 25.4.25.
- 6.5 Dogger Bank Creyke Beck Offshore Wind Farm Order 2015 NMC email dated 27.4.25.
- 6.6 Hornsea Four Offshore Wind Farm Update email dated 27.4.25.
- 6.7 Peartree Hill Solar Farm Development Consent Order email dated 27.4.25.
- 6.8 Resident Correspondence Village Green Parking email dated 28.4.25.
- 6.9 ERNLLCA April Newsletter Email dated April 28, 2025.
- 6.10 Humberside Police Crime Figures April Report email dated 3.5.25.
- 6.11 Hornsea 4 Offshore Wind Farm Update email dated 7.5.25.
- 6.12 Consultation on the Submission Ellerker Neighbourhood Plan email dated 9.5.25.
- 6.13 ERYC Little Bins & Benches update email dated 12.5.25.
- 6.14 Hull & EY Local Nature Recovery Strategy consultation open email dated 12.5.25.
- 6.15 Information about SEND Youth Clubs in your area email dated 12.5.25.
- 6.16 Ward Councillor Kingfisher Solar Farm/Hornsea 4 Update email dated 12.5.25.

<u> 25-26/7 Planning – All</u>

To review & submit observations for the following Planning Applications/Approvals

7.1 25/00991/TCA - Crown reduce two Purple Plum trees as illustrated, as they are overhanging the neighbouring boundary - Melody Cottage, South Glebe, Lockington East Riding of Yorkshire YO25 9ST – **ERYC Raise No Objections.**

25-26/8 Finances – Clerk

To review, debate and agree on the financial items below;

- 8.1 ERNLLCA Membership Fee 2025/26 £365.11
- 8.2 Zurich Insurance £467
- 8.3 Flowering Seed for Village Green £264
- 8.4 Internal audit £300
- 8.5 Budget update.

25-26/9 Public Participation Period - Items for Next Agenda

25-26/10 Date of next Meeting

Ordinary Parish Council Meeting (OPCM) on Tuesday 17th June 2025 @ 2000 hrs in the Village Hall.

Issued by; Gareth Rees Clerk to Lockington Parish Council Mobile: 07768233352 email: lpcclerk@outlook.com