

Lockington Parish Council
Meeting Agenda Monday 20th May 2024

Dear Sir/Madam,

I hereby give you notice that an ordinary meeting of Lockington Parish Council will take place on **Monday 20th May 2024 @ 8pm** (or on termination of the APM & APCM).

All members of the Parish Council are hereby summoned to attend, for the purpose of transacting the agenda items listed below:

All members of the public are welcome to attend.

Agenda Items (Subject to amendment)

24-25/1 To receive Apologies:

24-25/2 To approve the minutes of the Parish Council meeting that took place on the 18th of March 2024.

24-25/3 (a) To receive and record any 'Declaration of Interest' (Pecuniary, Non-Pecuniary and/or Prejudicial Interest), by any member of the Parish Council in respect to the agenda items listed.

24-25/3 (b) To record the nature of Declaration of Interest identified 'a' above.

The Declaration of Interest should be made at the commencement of the meeting.

24-25/4 To review and resolve any East Riding of Yorkshire (ERYC) Council Business:

- 4.1 24/00159/PLF - Laurel Farm Aike update.
- 4.2 Bracken Lane Verge Damage update.
- 4.3 Yorkshire Water Feedback – WWTP.
- 4.4 General - ERYC Feedback from Ward Councillor.

24-25/5 Parish Council ongoing Business Matters:

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 5.1 Dead Lane Pathway – Stone surface update.
- 5.2 Thorpe ground evaluation, subsequent registration, and potential sale.
- 5.3 D Day Celebrations – (Village Hall) update.
- 5.4 Community Governance Review - Final Recommendations Report.
- 5.5 Lockington/ERYC Highways Issues Spreadsheet review.
- 5.6 Consider Audit Review 23/24.

24-25/5 Parish Council ongoing Business Matters continued:

- 5.7 Speeding through Village update.
- 5.8 Village Walkabouts 24, conformation of attendance (Tuesday 11th June @ 0945 VH).
- 5.9 Concerns over new pipe installed beneath Front Street (East end).
- 5.10 Update on Amen Field Kilnwick Lane.

24-25/6 Correspondence/Clerk.

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 6.1 ERNLLCA March 24 Newsletter – email dated 4.4.24.
- 6.2 Humberside Police Crime Statistics - email dated 7.4.24.
- 6.3 ERYC Anti-Social Behaviour Report – email dated 23.4.24.
- 6.4 ERYC April 2024 Carriageway Patching Various Sites – email dated 23.4.24.
- 6.5 Information - Legacy Independent Funeral Directors – email dated 25.4.24.
- 6.6 Northern PowerGrid Foundation - Grant Funding available – email dated 26.4.24.
- 6.7 East Riding of Yorkshire Ward Boundary Review – email dated 8.5.24.
- 6.8 ERNLLCA - NALC model financial regulations 2024 – email dated 10.5.24.
- 6.9 ERNLLCA – May 24 Newsletter – email dated 10.5.24.
- 6.10 ERYC - Town and Parish Councillors' Bulletin – email dated 10.5.24.
- 6.11 Humberside Police Crime Statistics - email dated 13.5.24.
- 6.12 East Riding Local Plan Update - email dated 13.5.24.
- 6.13 Town and Parish Council Liaison Meetings Invitation - email dated 13.5.24.

24-25/7 Planning – All

To review & submit observations for the following Planning Applications/Approvals

- 7.1 Update on - 24/00159/PLF - Laurel Farm Aike Lane Aike East Riding of Yorkshire YO25 9BG - Installation of timber framed balcony with metal railings to rear following removal of existing timber balcony (**Retrospective Application - Expiry Date 29.4.24**).
- 7.2 Update on - 23/03338/PLF - Land Southwest of 71 Front Street Lockington East Riding of Yorkshire YO25 9SH - Change of use of land to create vehicular access and hardstanding for parking in connection with 11 Chapel Street including provision of drop kerb and erection of gates (**Retrospective Application - Expiry Date 10.5.24**).
- 7.3 24/00991/TCA - 9 South Glebe Lockington East Riding of Yorkshire YO25 9ST - Fell 1 no. Pussy Willow tree (T1) due to leaning over the public footpath and split in the trunk.
ERYC Raise No Objections.
- 7.4 24/01220/PLF - Raventhorpe Cottage Raventhorpe Estate Rootas Lane Cherry Burton East Riding of Yorkshire HU17 7RB - Erection of a single storey link extension to side – comments by 23rd May 2024 – **LPC to consider planning application.**

24-25/8 Finances – Clerk

To review, debate and agree on financial items below;

- 8.1 VH Hire April 23 to March 24 inclusive (Invoice 19th March) - £96.
- 8.2 ERYC - Salt Bin Maintenance 23/24 Winter Season (Invoice 95263275) - £117.60p.
- 8.3 Gazette Fisk Printers £79 (Invoice number 34740 Gazette Issue 145).
- 8.4 ERNLLCA Membership (Invoice number 1643) 2024 – 2025 - £355.60p.
- 8.5 Administration (Postage Stamps) - £43.20p.
- 8.6 Zurich Insurance renewal - £551.41p.
- 8.7 Village Hall Clock Repair - £96
- 8.8 Paint for Bus Shelter - £7.50p.
- 8.9 Budget review to date (Budget Sheet Revision 1.5).

24-25/9 Items for Next Agenda

24-25/10 Date of next Meeting

Ordinary Parish Council Meeting (OPCM) on Monday 17th June 2024 @ 1900 hrs in the Village Hall.

Issued by;
Gareth Rees
Clerk to Lockington Parish Council
Mobile: 07768233352
E mail: lpcclerk@outlook.com